
S.NO Öğr.No Ad, Soyad Sınıf D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N Sınıf Kurum İlçe İl Genel

7,14 7,17 4,75 6,65 3,04 5,64 3,14 1,73 2,56 3,39 2,48 2,56 7,4 6,12 5,36 7,19 6,76 4,93 34,9 27,3 25,8 301,78

6,78 7,45 4,29 6,35 3,29 5,26 3 1,84 2,39 2,6 2,1 1,91 7 6,41 4,86 6,94 7,08 4,58 32,7 28,2 23,29 291,71

1 291 TALHA     ALADAĞ 4D 13 2 12,33 10 0 10 4 1 3,67 5 0 5 15 0 15 15 0 15 62 3 61 471,509 1 1 1 1 2

2 629 UMUT      KIRLI 4H 13 1 12,67 10 0 10 5 0 5 4 1 3,67 14 1 13,67 15 0 15 61 3 60 466,644 1 3 3 3 5

3 1213 İSMAİLEMREMIH 4E 11 4 9,67 10 0 10 5 0 5 5 0 5 15 0 15 14 0 14 60 4 58,67 454,168 2 4 4 4 7

4 0 EGEMEN    ULUDAĞ 4C 11 4 9,67 10 0 10 5 0 5 5 0 5 15 0 15 13 2 12,3 59 6 57 445,124 1 6 6 6 11

5 553 AHMET ENESŞAHİN 4G 13 2 12,33 10 0 10 4 1 3,67 5 0 5 14 1 13,67 12 3 11 58 7 55,67 442,345 1 7 7 7 12

6 943 İBRAHİMEFEADAR 4B 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 5 0 5 4 1 3,67 14 1 13,67 13 2 12,3 56 9 53 432,107 2 9 9 9 15

7 593 YUSUF     TURHAN  12 1 11,67 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 4 0 4 13 2 12,33 12 1 11,7 53 7 50,67 426,882 1 10 10 10 18

8 452 MEHMET    BAYRAK 4A 11 4 9,67 10 0 10 5 0 5 4 1 3,67 14 1 13,67 11 4 9,67 55 10 51,67 420,551 1 11 11 11 21

9 83 İBRAHİM   FUTTU 4B 11 4 9,67 10 0 10 3 2 2,33 3 1 2,67 15 0 15 11 4 9,67 53 11 49,33 419,365 3 13 13 13 23

10 649 MUHAMMED  ZAVRAK 4H 13 2 12,33 10 0 10 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 13 1 12,67 10 5 8,33 53 11 49,33 416,994 2 14 14 14 27

11 0 İDRİS EMİN ÇELİK 4H 10 5 8,33 10 0 10 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 12 2 11,33 13 2 12,3 53 11 49,33 411,018 4 17 17 17 30

12 524 HASAN ALİ TÜRKUĞURLU 4G 10 5 8,33 10 0 10 5 0 5 3 2 2,33 12 3 11 13 2 12,3 53 12 49 409,84 2 18 18 18 31

13 777 YAVUZ     KÜRKCÜ 4H 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 14 1 13,67 12 3 11 51 14 46,33 407,944 6 20 20 20 34

14 250 FURKAN    KÜÇÜKBÖĞET 4D 11 4 9,67 7 3 6 5 0 5 1 4 -0,33 14 0 14 11 4 9,67 49 15 44 405,74 2 21 21 21 35

15 0 Y C       TR ĞKKİÜ* 4B 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 2 2 1,33 12 3 11 11 4 9,67 49 15 44 394,764 4 25 25 25 41

16 534 M ZAHİD 4G 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 14 1 13,67 11 4 9,67 49 16 43,67 388,794 5 28 28 28 46

17 346 MUHAMMED  ÖZCAN 4E 8 6 6 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 1 2,67 11 3 10 13 2 12,3 48 14 43,33 385,323 5 31 31 31 50

18 603 RAMAZAN   KIZILDOĞAN 4H 10 4 8,67 7 2 6,33 5 0 5 2 1 1,67 11 2 10,33 10 2 9,33 45 11 41,33 382,4 11 33 33 33 52

19 0 YİĞİT     KUYUCU 4D 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,67 48 17 42,33 381,832 4 34 34 34 53

20 623 MEVLÜT    UĞUR 4H 9 6 7 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 13 2 12,33 10 5 8,33 48 17 42,33 381,724 12 35 35 35 54

21 10 ERDEM     KOPTAGEL 4E 7 8 4,33 10 0 10 5 0 5 4 1 3,67 12 3 11 11 3 10 49 15 44 376,954 6 37 37 37 56

22 654 DURSU N   Y*UZ 4L 12 3 11 7 3 6 5 0 5 3 2 2,33 11 3 10 8 7 5,67 46 18 40 374,572 2 40 40 40 59

23 131 AHMET ERENŞİMŞEK 4B 5 9 2 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 3 0 3 13 1 12,67 12 3 11 45 16 39,67 367,465 5 43 43 43 66

24 0 ALPEREN   ŞAN 4C 9 6 7 7 3 6 4 1 3,67 5 0 5 8 7 5,67 13 2 12,3 46 19 39,67 365,6 3 44 44 44 67

25 282 ALİ BERK  GÖKCE 4D 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 10 5 8,33 9 3 8 45 17 39,33 364,894 7 45 45 45 69

26 409 NUSRETEMİNAKSAY 4G 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 6 0 6 13 2 12,3 43 13 38,67 360,384 8 46 46 46 71

27 51 OSMANEMİR KUŞ  8 7 5,67 5 5 3,33 4 1 3,67 2 3 1 11 4 9,67 12 3 11 42 23 34,33 359,354 2 47 47 47 72

28 0 HALİS EMİRBIÇAK 4C 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 5 0 5 6 6 4 10 2 9,33 44 15 39 358,159 4 48 48 48 74

29 588 EMİR      GÖZEL 4H 9 6 7 10 0 10 2 3 1 3 2 2,33 11 3 10 8 7 5,67 43 21 36 350,456 14 51 51 51 81

30 231 MUSTAFA   ŞAH İN 4B 9 6 7 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 1 2,67 10 3 9 8 7 5,67 43 19 36,67 349,27 7 53 53 53 84

31 108 ÖMER ARUK BÜYÜKBACAK 4L 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 11 2 10,33 6 9 3 43 20 36,33 348,948 3 54 54 54 85

32 72 MİRAÇ     KAVLAK 4A 8 7 5,67 7 3 6 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 8 7 5,67 11 4 9,67 42 23 34,33 340,863 2 56 56 56 89

33 0 HİDAYET   ÖZSAĞLAM 4C 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 11 4 9,67 42 23 34,33 340,718 6 57 57 57 90

34 557 MUSTAFA   BUDAKLI 4G 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 7 8 4,33 42 23 34,33 337,975 9 59 59 59 93

35 365 ÖMER SEMİHKAYA 4G 8 2 7,33 9 0 9 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 1 0 1 10 1 9,67 36 5 34,33 330,848 11 63 63 63 97

36 0 MUHAMMED   KARADAYI 4E 8 4 6,67 7 2 6,33 3 1 2,67 3 1 2,67 8 2 7,33 7 4 5,67 36 14 31,33 330,444 8 64 64 64 98

37 0 İSA KEREM KALKAN  7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 9 6 7 9 6 7 41 24 33 329,142 3 65 65 65 99

38 77 MEHMETAKİFAR 4A 10 5 8,33 9 1 8,67 5 0 5 4 1 3,67 8 7 5,67 6 9 3 42 23 34,33 329,092 4 66 66 66 100

39 0 ENESKAĞA  TIMRAŞ 4C 5 9 2 7 3 6 3 2 2,33 5 0 5 8 2 7,33 10 4 8,67 38 20 31,33 323,11 8 69 69 69 105

40 0 ALİ EMİR  ŞAHİN  5 10 1,67 5 5 3,33 2 3 1 4 1 3,67 11 4 9,67 10 5 8,33 37 28 27,67 320,642 5 71 71 71 109

41 0 NABİ      AKGÜN 4A 6 7 3,67 9 1 8,67 4 1 3,67 2 2 1,33 8 5 6,33 9 6 7 38 22 30,67 319,89 5 72 72 72 110
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42 675 MUSTAFA   GÜLDENİZ 4İ 7 6 5 7 2 6,33 3 1 2,67 2 1 1,67 8 2 7,33 7 4 5,67 34 16 28,67 318,932 1 74 74 74 113

43 398 HASANBASRİUÇAR 4F 9 2 8,33 5 1 4,67 3 0 3 2 0 2 6 0 6 4 2 3,33 29 5 27,33 315,72 3 77 77 77 116

44 454 GHAFOOR   SAİFİ 4İ 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 9 6 7 38 27 29 315,71 2 78 78 78 117

45 344 EMİRTAHA  GÜNDOĞDU 4E 7 8 4,33 8 2 7,33 3 2 2,33 4 1 3,67 8 6 6 8 7 5,67 38 26 29,33 312,983 10 79 79 79 120

46 0 VAHİT     FUTTU 4B 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 9 6 7 7 8 4,33 38 27 29 311,611 9 80 80 80 121

47 88 YUSUF     ÇAPAN 4B 5 10 1,67 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 2 2 1,33 8 7 5,67 10 4 8,67 37 26 28,33 310,856 10 82 82 82 123

48 0 BEYKAN    GÖKALP 4D 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,67 3 2 2,33 2 2 1,33 7 7 4,67 7 8 4,33 35 28 25,67 310,702 9 83 83 83 124

49 5 OĞUZHAN   KOÇ 4C 6 9 3 7 2 6,33 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 8 5 6,33 8 6 6 36 25 27,67 307,534 10 84 84 84 125

50 402 OKTAY     GÜDEK 4F 9 4 7,67 8 2 7,33 2 3 1 3 2 2,33 4 7 1,67 7 2 6,33 33 20 26,33 305,445 4 87 87 87 129

51 550 SÜLEYMAN  IŞI K  6 6 4 8 2 7,33 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 7 8 4,33 35 27 26 299,333 6 92 92 92 136

52 457 YUNUS EMRE PALTACI 4G 8 7 5,67 6 4 4,67 5 0 5 2 3 1 8 7 5,67 5 10 1,67 34 31 23,67 292,579 14 97 97 97 146

53 479 EROL      DEVEC   İ 4F 10 5 8,33 6 3 5 1 3 0 3 1 2,67 8 6 6 2 6 0 30 24 22 292,188 6 98 98 98 147

54 0 UMUTCAN   DEMİR 4H 4 11 0,33 6 4 4,67 2 3 1 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 10 5 8,33 33 32 22,33 290,917 16 100 100 100 149

55 1005 KAMİL     YAVUZDEMİR 4F 6 6 4 6 1 5,67 2 1 1,67 2 1 1,67 6 4 4,67 7 7 4,67 29 20 22,33 288,918 7 104 104 104 153

56 490 MBURAK    KILINÇ 4G 8 7 5,67 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 2 3 1 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,67 34 31 23,67 287,62 15 105 105 105 154

57 0 MAH UDSAMİBALIKCI 4A 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 2 3 1 7 8 4,33 5 10 1,67 34 31 23,67 287,204 7 106 106 106 155

58 90 YUSUF     ÇAYIR 4B 9 6 7 6 4 4,67 4 1 3,67 3 3 2 8 6 6 3 12 -1 33 32 22,33 286,248 11 108 108 108 157

59 0 SALİHYUSUFKURT 4C 5 6 3 5 4 3,67 3 2 2,33 2 3 1 7 4 5,67 7 7 4,67 29 26 20,33 284,766 14 110 110 110 160

60 0 YİĞİT     ALGAÇ 4D 5 10 1,67 9 0 9 3 2 2,33 4 1 3,67 6 9 3 8 7 5,67 35 29 25,33 284,601 13 112 112 112 162

61 373 MEVLÜTERENOK 4F 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,67 5 0 5 2 3 1 6 9 3 7 8 4,33 33 32 22,33 284,512 8 113 113 113 163

62 0 KEMALBUĞRAKUŞ 4A 5 10 1,67 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 1 4 -0,33 5 7 2,67 8 3 7 31 27 22 281,312 8 114 114 114 164

63 223 CENGİZHAN ÖZTAŞ 4A 5 10 1,67 6 4 4,67 2 3 1 3 2 2,33 9 6 7 6 9 3 31 34 19,67 277,056 9 118 118 118 169

64 680 MUHAMMED  KARAPI AR  9 6 7 6 4 4,67 1 4 -0,33 3 2 2,33 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 30 35 18,33 274,83 9 119 119 119 170

65 91 MEHMET EFEDELİKTAŞ  9 5 7,33 5 5 3,33 1 4 -0,33 3 2 2,33 8 7 5,67 3 12 -1 29 35 17,33 274,043 10 120 120 120 172

66 1028 BATUHANNUHSEVGİLİ 4F 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,67 5 0 5 3 2 2,33 5 10 1,67 5 10 1,67 34 31 23,67 273,972 9 121 121 121 173

67 0 CELAL     NOYANY 4L 5 10 1,67 6 4 4,67 3 2 2,33 3 3 2 9 6 7 5 10 1,67 31 35 19,33 272,49 6 122 122 122 174

68 0 BERATYASİRBU*UNMAZ 4K 5 10 1,67 5 5 3,33 4 1 3,67 5 1 4,67 7 8 4,33 6 8 3,33 32 33 21 272,323 2 123 123 123 175

69 0 KEREM     TOSUN 4H 6 9 3 6 4 4,67 4 1 3,67 4 1 3,67 8 7 5,67 4 11 0,33 32 33 21 272,056 17 125 125 125 177

70 0 MEHMET   NÖZCAN 4H 7 8 4,33 7 3 6 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 5 10 1,67 6 9 3 32 33 21 272,047 18 126 126 126 178

71 387 OĞUZHAN   SEVGİLİ 4F 4 11 0,33 8 2 7,33 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 7 8 4,33 7 8 4,33 32 33 21 270,914 10 127 127 127 179

72 0 NURULLAH  SANCAK  7 7 4,67 7 3 6 4 1 3,67 1 4 -0,33 6 8 3,33 5 10 1,67 30 33 19 270,751 11 129 129 129 181

73 0 ALİARDA   DURSUN 4H 6 9 3 5 5 3,33 3 2 2,33 3 3 2 8 7 5,67 5 10 1,67 30 36 18 269,741 19 130 130 130 183

74 0 A  C*İE   A*AH*M 4B 5 9 2 8 2 7,33 4 1 3,67 2 1 1,67 6 8 3,33 6 9 3 31 30 21 269,622 12 131 131 131 184

75 615 DAVUT     YAŞAR 4H 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 1 4 -0,33 7 7 4,67 3 10 -0,33 30 32 19,33 267,949 20 132 132 132 185

76 0 EYMEN     DEN * 4B 6 9 3 8 2 7,33 2 3 1 2 3 1 6 9 3 6 9 3 30 35 18,33 265,491 13 134 134 134 189

77 651 MUSTAFA   ARICI 4H 8 7 5,67 5 5 3,33 3 2 2,33 3 3 2 4 11 0,33 5 7 2,67 28 35 16,33 260,582 21 135 135 135 190

78 0 MUSTAFA   KUMAŞ 4D 7 8 4,33 6 4 4,67 4 1 3,67 3 2 2,33 3 3 2 3 6 1 26 24 18 260,144 14 137 137 137 192

79 0 YİĞİTEYMENBALTAC I 4L 7 6 5 6 3 5 2 1 1,67 1 1 0,67 5 7 2,67 4 9 1 25 27 16 260,112 8 138 138 138 193

80 0 İSA CAN   ÇAKICI  5 10 1,67 10 0 10 3 2 2,33 4 1 3,67 6 9 3 3 11 -0,67 31 33 20 252,419 12 146 146 146 201

81 540 İSMAİÖ    ÖZSLAN 4G 5 10 1,67 4 5 2,33 2 3 1 2 3 1 7 8 4,33 5 9 2 25 38 12,33 248,97 17 151 151 151 207

82 0 ÖMER  EMİRAVKUŞ 4B 7 7 4,67 8 1 7,67 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 4 11 0,33 3 12 -1 28 35 16,33 245,102 15 154 154 154 212

83 41 EBUBEKİR  CERAN 4C 5 10 1,67 7 3 6 3 2 2,33 2 3 1 3 12 -1 7 8 4,33 27 38 14,33 243,147 17 155 155 155 214

84 516 EYMEN     FAK 4G 4 8 1,33 4 3 3 3 0 3 2 1 1,67 5 2 4,33 2 7 -0,33 20 21 13 242,178 18 156 156 156 215

85 0 MEHMETEYMEGÜÇ 4B 4 11 0,33 5 5 3,33 2 3 1 2 5 0,33 8 7 5,67 4 11 0,33 25 42 11 240,624 16 158 158 158 217

86 0 YUSU F    UÇAR 4K 5 10 1,67 7 3 6 3 2 2,33 3 2 2,33 3 11 -0,67 6 9 3 27 37 14,67 240,42 6 159 159 159 218

87 649 BAYRAM    * NMEZ 4H 9 6 7 5 5 3,33 0 4 -1,33 0 3 -1 5 10 1,67 2 10 -1,33 21 38 8,33 238,848 22 162 162 162 222



88 0 MUSTAFA   KONCA  4 10 0,67 4 6 2 1 4 -0,33 2 5 0,33 7 8 4,33 4 8 1,33 22 41 8,33 234,254 15 166 166 166 228

89 299 AHMETSIRAÇSALİM 4E 5 10 1,67 3 7 0,67 3 2 2,33 2 3 1 5 10 1,67 5 9 2 23 41 9,33 233,742 14 167 167 167 229

90 0 A L İ     CEYLAN 4L 4 11 0,33 5 5 3,33 3 2 2,33 1 4 -0,33 6 9 3 3 6 1 22 37 9,67 231,336 10 174 174 174 236

91 430 MUSTAFA   ŞAHİN 4F 7 8 4,33 4 6 2 2 3 1 1 4 -0,33 3 12 -1 5 10 1,67 22 43 7,67 229,203 15 176 176 176 238

92 0 HÜSEYİN   SUCU 4C 4 9 1 5 5 3,33 3 2 2,33 0 3 -1 4 8 1,33 5 10 1,67 21 37 8,67 228,121 18 177 177 177 239

93 0 YAKUPEMİR TETİK 4F 5 10 1,67 6 4 4,67 3 1 2,67 1 4 -0,33 2 7 -0,33 5 10 1,67 22 36 10 227,679 16 179 179 179 241

94 585 UĞURERDEM KARAKÜÇÜK 4D 8 7 5,67 3 6 1 3 2 2,33 2 3 1 3 12 -1 3 12 -1 22 42 8 226,144 17 181 181 181 243

95 798 YUSUF     TARHAN 4H 4 11 0,33 2 8 -0,67 1 4 -0,33 1 4 -0,33 6 9 3 5 9 2 19 45 4 221,357 23 182 182 182 245

96 751 HASAN     BÜYÜKLER 4L 5 10 1,67 6 3 5 0 5 -1,67 0 6 -2 6 9 3 3 12 -1 20 45 5 218,452 11 183 183 183 249

97 269 UĞUR HERATKARACA 4D 7 8 4,33 2 8 -0,67 1 4 -0,33 0 7 -2,33 4 11 0,33 2 4 0,67 16 42 2 218,108 18 185 185 185 251

98 49 E*A Y     KIRG*L 4A 5 10 1,67 5 5 3,33 2 3 1 0 5 -1,67 5 10 1,67 3 12 -1 20 45 5 214,673 14 187 187 187 253

99 0 MUHAMETALİSOYTÜR K 4B 6 8 3,33 0 10 -3,33 2 3 1 1 4 -0,33 4 10 0,67 3 12 -1 16 47 0,33 206,679 19 190 190 190 258

100 0 ÇAĞLAR    TAŞKIN 4L 3 12 -1 6 4 4,67 0 5 -1,67 2 3 1 4 8 1,33 4 11 0,33 19 43 4,67 206,34 12 191 191 191 259

101 0 MEHMET    ÇETİN 4B 2 13 -2,33 5 5 3,33 3 2 2,33 1 4 -0,33 1 14 -3,67 7 7 4,67 19 45 4 198,699 20 197 197 197 265

102 39 SÜLEYMAN  EL ASSAF 4L 3 12 -1 0 10 -3,33 2 3 1 1 4 -0,33 4 10 0,67 5 10 1,67 15 49 -1,33 196,376 13 201 201 201 269

103 20 ZEKERİYA  SARI 4G 4 10 0,67 1 8 -1,67 0 5 -1,67 1 4 -0,33 3 12 -1 5 9 2 14 48 -2 195,373 22 202 202 202 270

104 0 MEHMETERENİPEK 4C 2 11 -1,67 3 5 1,33 1 4 -0,33 1 3 0 4 6 2 2 8 -0,67 13 37 0,67 194,892 20 203 203 203 271

105 831 ŞABAN     AVCI 4İ 6 9 3 3 7 0,67 0 5 -1,67 0 5 -1,67 1 14 -3,67 5 10 1,67 15 50 -1,67 194,445 11 204 204 204 272

106 307 YUSUF     DOĞAN 4A 5 10 1,67 3 7 0,67 2 3 1 3 2 2,33 2 13 -2,33 3 12 -1 18 47 2,33 194,403 15 205 205 205 273

107 0 BEA*REK   *  M* 4A 5 10 1,67 4 6 2 1 4 -0,33 3 2 2,33 3 12 -1 2 13 -2,33 18 47 2,33 194,209 16 206 206 206 274

108 0 YAŞA EYMENERTUTAR 4K 3 12 -1 3 7 0,67 4 1 3,67 2 3 1 4 10 0,67 2 13 -2,33 18 46 2,67 192,719 7 207 207 207 275

109 0 MUHAMMET  ERGÜN 4L 3 12 -1 3 7 0,67 2 3 1 2 3 1 1 14 -3,67 5 10 1,67 16 49 -0,33 183,527 15 210 210 210 278

110 0 ZAFER     ÖZER 4L 4 11 0,33 2 8 -0,67 0 5 -1,67 4 2 3,33 3 10 -0,33 2 13 -2,33 15 49 -1,33 183,138 16 211 211 211 279

111 0 NECATİYİĞİT*M ÜŞ 4E 1 12 -3 2 8 -0,67 2 3 1 2 3 1 3 12 -1 4 10 0,67 14 48 -2 178,667 17 212 212 212 280

112 0 OZAN      AYDIN 4K 2 7 -0,33 1 3 0 0 2 -0,67 0 3 -1 1 8 -1,67 2 7 -0,33 6 30 -4 178,085 8 213 213 213 281

113 413 ÖMERALİ   KALAYCI 4F 4 11 0,33 2 8 -0,67 1 4 -0,33 1 4 -0,33 3 12 -1 2 13 -2,33 13 52 -4,33 175,469 19 214 214 214 282

114 577 FATİHBUĞRAALTUNBAŞ 4 3 12 -1 2 8 -0,67 1 4 -0,33 0 5 -1,67 3 12 -1 2 13 -2,33 11 54 -7 165,202 2 216 216 216 284

115 28 R*N       *  Z * 4İ 3 12 -1 0 10 -3,33 1 4 -0,33 1 4 -0,33 1 14 -3,67 4 11 0,33 10 55 -8,33 161,573 12 217 217 217 285

116 803 MUHAMMEDEM ENSEVINÇ 4E 1 10 -2,33 0 10 -3,33 1 4 -0,33 0 5 -1,67 1 14 -3,67 4 11 0,33 7 54 -11 151,306 18 219 219 219 287


